
BID #: 7281
June 24, 2011, 2:00pm

Bulk Chemicals
DEPARTMENT: 

NPU
ITEM BRIEF DESCRIPTION UNIT UNIT  PRICE RENTAL UNIT  PRICE RENTAL

1 Liquid Polymer (approx 1800 gal / 50lb drum) LB no bid no bid

2 Liquid Ferric Chloride (approx 4000 gal /15 gal drum) GAL no bid no bid

3 Liquid Ferric Chloride (approx 7000 gal /275 gal tote) GAL no bid no bid

4
Liquid Cationic Praestol K 144 L (approx 5000 gal /275 gal 
tote) GAL 16.47 no bid

5 Sodium Hypochlorite

5a 1000-1500 gallon shipment - 1 plant GAL no bid 1.14

5b 1500-2000 gallon shipment - 1 plant GAL no bid 1.06

5c 2000-2500 gallon shipment - 2 plants GAL no bid 1.01

5d 2500-3000 gallon shipment - 2 plants GAL no bid 0.92

5e 3000-3500 gallon shipment - 2 plants GAL no bid 0.84

6 Liquid Chlorine (approx 18 tons / one ton cylinder) TON no bid no bid

7 Caustic Soda (approx 35,000 gal) CWT no bid no bid

NA2O Concentration

Tank Truck Capacity

8 Liquid Aluminum Sulfate (approx 60,000 gal) TON no bid no bid

Tank Truck Capacity

9 Hydrofluosilicic acid (approx 8000 gal) GAL no bid no bid

Tank Truck Capacity

Concentration

10 Copper Sulfate (approx 8 ton / 50 lb bag) BAG no bid 108.00

Manufacturer

11 Calgon C-39 (approx 17 ton / 50 lb bag) BAG 74.25$      Aquadene no bid

12 Magnafloc 1t 7981 Liquid Polymer (approx 750 gal) GAL 14.856$    PHI-850 no bid

13 Domestic Sodium Floride (approx 7 tons / 50 lb bag) EA no bid no bid

14 Liquid Aluminum Chlorohydrate (approx 8000 gal) GAL 5.25$        PHI-23180 no bid

15 Solid Copper Sulfate Compound (approx 4200 lbs) LB no bid no bid

16 Liquid Chelated Copper (approx 1200 gal) no bid no bid

Delivered and unloaded in totes LB no bid no bid

Delivered and unloaded in tons LB no bid no bid

17 Hydrogen Dioxide (approx 77,000 lbs / 50lb bags) LB no bid no bid

4

Old Bridge

delivered
1% 10; net 30

bank ck $1728 + $2100

H Krevit & Co
67 Welton St

New Haven CT  06511

FOB
TERMS

SURETY

Pristine Water Solutions Inc
1570 S Lakeside Dr

Waukegan IL  60085

not stated
not stated

bank ck $5259.00 + $4042



BID #: 7281
June 24, 2011, 2:00pm

Bulk Chemicals
DEPARTMENT: 

NPU
ITEM BRIEF DESCRIPTION UNIT

1 Liquid Polymer (approx 1800 gal / 50lb drum) LB

2 Liquid Ferric Chloride (approx 4000 gal /15 gal drum) GAL

3 Liquid Ferric Chloride (approx 7000 gal /275 gal tote) GAL

4
Liquid Cationic Praestol K 144 L (approx 5000 gal /275 gal 
tote) GAL

5 Sodium Hypochlorite

5a 1000-1500 gallon shipment - 1 plant GAL

5b 1500-2000 gallon shipment - 1 plant GAL

5c 2000-2500 gallon shipment - 2 plants GAL

5d 2500-3000 gallon shipment - 2 plants GAL

5e 3000-3500 gallon shipment - 2 plants GAL

6 Liquid Chlorine (approx 18 tons / one ton cylinder) TON

7 Caustic Soda (approx 35,000 gal) CWT

NA2O Concentration

Tank Truck Capacity

8 Liquid Aluminum Sulfate (approx 60,000 gal) TON

Tank Truck Capacity

9 Hydrofluosilicic acid (approx 8000 gal) GAL

Tank Truck Capacity

Concentration

10 Copper Sulfate (approx 8 ton / 50 lb bag) BAG

Manufacturer

11 Calgon C-39 (approx 17 ton / 50 lb bag) BAG

12 Magnafloc 1t 7981 Liquid Polymer (approx 750 gal) GAL

13 Domestic Sodium Floride (approx 7 tons / 50 lb bag) EA

14 Liquid Aluminum Chlorohydrate (approx 8000 gal) GAL

15 Solid Copper Sulfate Compound (approx 4200 lbs) LB

16 Liquid Chelated Copper (approx 1200 gal)

Delivered and unloaded in totes LB

Delivered and unloaded in tons LB

17 Hydrogen Dioxide (approx 77,000 lbs / 50lb bags) LB
FOB

TERMS
SURETY

UNIT  PRICE RENTAL UNIT  PRICE RENTAL

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

11.78$      no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid 34.94$      

no bid 472.00$    

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

38.00-39.5%

4400-4500 gallons

3600-3800 gallons

destination
not stated

5% bid bond

General Chemical LLC
90 E Halsey Rd

Parsippany NJ  07054

Hercules Inc / Ashland
1313 N Market St

Wilmington DE  19894

Norwich CT
net 30

5% bid bond



BID #: 7281
June 24, 2011, 2:00pm

Bulk Chemicals
DEPARTMENT: 

NPU
ITEM BRIEF DESCRIPTION UNIT

1 Liquid Polymer (approx 1800 gal / 50lb drum) LB

2 Liquid Ferric Chloride (approx 4000 gal /15 gal drum) GAL

3 Liquid Ferric Chloride (approx 7000 gal /275 gal tote) GAL

4
Liquid Cationic Praestol K 144 L (approx 5000 gal /275 gal 
tote) GAL

5 Sodium Hypochlorite

5a 1000-1500 gallon shipment - 1 plant GAL

5b 1500-2000 gallon shipment - 1 plant GAL

5c 2000-2500 gallon shipment - 2 plants GAL

5d 2500-3000 gallon shipment - 2 plants GAL

5e 3000-3500 gallon shipment - 2 plants GAL

6 Liquid Chlorine (approx 18 tons / one ton cylinder) TON

7 Caustic Soda (approx 35,000 gal) CWT

NA2O Concentration

Tank Truck Capacity

8 Liquid Aluminum Sulfate (approx 60,000 gal) TON

Tank Truck Capacity

9 Hydrofluosilicic acid (approx 8000 gal) GAL

Tank Truck Capacity

Concentration

10 Copper Sulfate (approx 8 ton / 50 lb bag) BAG

Manufacturer

11 Calgon C-39 (approx 17 ton / 50 lb bag) BAG

12 Magnafloc 1t 7981 Liquid Polymer (approx 750 gal) GAL

13 Domestic Sodium Floride (approx 7 tons / 50 lb bag) EA

14 Liquid Aluminum Chlorohydrate (approx 8000 gal) GAL

15 Solid Copper Sulfate Compound (approx 4200 lbs) LB

16 Liquid Chelated Copper (approx 1200 gal)

Delivered and unloaded in totes LB

Delivered and unloaded in tons LB

17 Hydrogen Dioxide (approx 77,000 lbs / 50lb bags) LB
FOB

TERMS
SURETY

UNIT  PRICE RENTAL UNIT  PRICE RENTAL

no bid

7.7330$    

4.9547$    

no bid

0.9744$    

0.8375$    

0.7750$    

0.7083$    

0.6786$    

no bid

25.64$      

no bid

3.69

no bid

no bid

no bid

90.87$      

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

6.38

4000

4000

23-25%

NO BID

Fall River MA
net 30

5% bid bond

Solvay North America LLC
3333 Richmond Ave
Houston TX  77098

Borden & Remington Corp
63 Water St

Fall River MA  02721-1559



BID #: 7281
June 24, 2011, 2:00pm

Bulk Chemicals
DEPARTMENT: 

NPU
ITEM BRIEF DESCRIPTION UNIT

1 Liquid Polymer (approx 1800 gal / 50lb drum) LB

2 Liquid Ferric Chloride (approx 4000 gal /15 gal drum) GAL

3 Liquid Ferric Chloride (approx 7000 gal /275 gal tote) GAL

4
Liquid Cationic Praestol K 144 L (approx 5000 gal /275 gal 
tote) GAL

5 Sodium Hypochlorite

5a 1000-1500 gallon shipment - 1 plant GAL

5b 1500-2000 gallon shipment - 1 plant GAL

5c 2000-2500 gallon shipment - 2 plants GAL

5d 2500-3000 gallon shipment - 2 plants GAL

5e 3000-3500 gallon shipment - 2 plants GAL

6 Liquid Chlorine (approx 18 tons / one ton cylinder) TON

7 Caustic Soda (approx 35,000 gal) CWT

NA2O Concentration

Tank Truck Capacity

8 Liquid Aluminum Sulfate (approx 60,000 gal) TON

Tank Truck Capacity

9 Hydrofluosilicic acid (approx 8000 gal) GAL

Tank Truck Capacity

Concentration

10 Copper Sulfate (approx 8 ton / 50 lb bag) BAG

Manufacturer

11 Calgon C-39 (approx 17 ton / 50 lb bag) BAG

12 Magnafloc 1t 7981 Liquid Polymer (approx 750 gal) GAL

13 Domestic Sodium Floride (approx 7 tons / 50 lb bag) EA

14 Liquid Aluminum Chlorohydrate (approx 8000 gal) GAL

15 Solid Copper Sulfate Compound (approx 4200 lbs) LB

16 Liquid Chelated Copper (approx 1200 gal)

Delivered and unloaded in totes LB

Delivered and unloaded in tons LB

17 Hydrogen Dioxide (approx 77,000 lbs / 50lb bags) LB
FOB

TERMS
SURETY

UNIT  PRICE RENTAL UNIT  PRICE RENTAL
$1.85; $1.32; 
and $2.50 -$                    no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

11.36$          no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid 147.00$    

18.00$          no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

bank ck $4998
net 30

5% bid bond

Shannon Chemical
602 Jefferson Cir

Exton PA  19341-2539

Exton PA
net 30

Atlantic Coast Polymers Inc
6207 Bee Caves Rd

Austin TX  78746

Norwich CT



BID #: 7281
June 24, 2011, 2:00pm

Bulk Chemicals
DEPARTMENT: 

NPU
ITEM BRIEF DESCRIPTION UNIT

1 Liquid Polymer (approx 1800 gal / 50lb drum) LB

2 Liquid Ferric Chloride (approx 4000 gal /15 gal drum) GAL

3 Liquid Ferric Chloride (approx 7000 gal /275 gal tote) GAL

4
Liquid Cationic Praestol K 144 L (approx 5000 gal /275 gal 
tote) GAL

5 Sodium Hypochlorite

5a 1000-1500 gallon shipment - 1 plant GAL

5b 1500-2000 gallon shipment - 1 plant GAL

5c 2000-2500 gallon shipment - 2 plants GAL

5d 2500-3000 gallon shipment - 2 plants GAL

5e 3000-3500 gallon shipment - 2 plants GAL

6 Liquid Chlorine (approx 18 tons / one ton cylinder) TON

7 Caustic Soda (approx 35,000 gal) CWT

NA2O Concentration

Tank Truck Capacity

8 Liquid Aluminum Sulfate (approx 60,000 gal) TON

Tank Truck Capacity

9 Hydrofluosilicic acid (approx 8000 gal) GAL

Tank Truck Capacity

Concentration

10 Copper Sulfate (approx 8 ton / 50 lb bag) BAG

Manufacturer

11 Calgon C-39 (approx 17 ton / 50 lb bag) BAG

12 Magnafloc 1t 7981 Liquid Polymer (approx 750 gal) GAL

13 Domestic Sodium Floride (approx 7 tons / 50 lb bag) EA

14 Liquid Aluminum Chlorohydrate (approx 8000 gal) GAL

15 Solid Copper Sulfate Compound (approx 4200 lbs) LB

16 Liquid Chelated Copper (approx 1200 gal)

Delivered and unloaded in totes LB

Delivered and unloaded in tons LB

17 Hydrogen Dioxide (approx 77,000 lbs / 50lb bags) LB
FOB

TERMS
SURETY

UNIT  PRICE RENTAL UNIT  PRICE RENTAL

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid 85.50 min 40 bags

no bid no bid

16.15$      min. 250 gal no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

net 30
bank ck $1368

Indeco

Farmingdale NJ

136 Newbury St
Framingham MA  01701

not stated
1% 10 days; net 30

5% bid bond

AICCoyne Chemical
3015 State Rd

Croyden PA  19021-6962



BID #: 7281
June 24, 2011, 2:00pm

Bulk Chemicals
DEPARTMENT: 

NPU
ITEM BRIEF DESCRIPTION UNIT

1 Liquid Polymer (approx 1800 gal / 50lb drum) LB

2 Liquid Ferric Chloride (approx 4000 gal /15 gal drum) GAL

3 Liquid Ferric Chloride (approx 7000 gal /275 gal tote) GAL

4
Liquid Cationic Praestol K 144 L (approx 5000 gal /275 gal 
tote) GAL

5 Sodium Hypochlorite

5a 1000-1500 gallon shipment - 1 plant GAL

5b 1500-2000 gallon shipment - 1 plant GAL

5c 2000-2500 gallon shipment - 2 plants GAL

5d 2500-3000 gallon shipment - 2 plants GAL

5e 3000-3500 gallon shipment - 2 plants GAL

6 Liquid Chlorine (approx 18 tons / one ton cylinder) TON

7 Caustic Soda (approx 35,000 gal) CWT

NA2O Concentration

Tank Truck Capacity

8 Liquid Aluminum Sulfate (approx 60,000 gal) TON

Tank Truck Capacity

9 Hydrofluosilicic acid (approx 8000 gal) GAL

Tank Truck Capacity

Concentration

10 Copper Sulfate (approx 8 ton / 50 lb bag) BAG

Manufacturer

11 Calgon C-39 (approx 17 ton / 50 lb bag) BAG

12 Magnafloc 1t 7981 Liquid Polymer (approx 750 gal) GAL

13 Domestic Sodium Floride (approx 7 tons / 50 lb bag) EA

14 Liquid Aluminum Chlorohydrate (approx 8000 gal) GAL

15 Solid Copper Sulfate Compound (approx 4200 lbs) LB

16 Liquid Chelated Copper (approx 1200 gal)

Delivered and unloaded in totes LB

Delivered and unloaded in tons LB

17 Hydrogen Dioxide (approx 77,000 lbs / 50lb bags) LB
FOB

TERMS
SURETY

UNIT  PRICE RENTAL UNIT  PRICE RENTAL

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid 1.0000$    

no bid 0.8676$    

no bid 0.8676$    

no bid 0.7676$    

no bid 0.7248$    

1,200.00$ none no bid

no bid 27.1500$  

no bid

no bid 4.1230$    

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid 48.67$      

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

50%

3500 gallons

5% bid bond
2% 10 days; net 30

Norwich CT 

10.00

net 30
5% bid bond

4000 gallons

delivered

JCI Jones Chemicals

Warwick NY  10990

Univar USA Inc
175 Terminal Rd

Providence RI  02905
103 River St



BID #: 7281
June 24, 2011, 2:00pm

Bulk Chemicals
DEPARTMENT: 

NPU
ITEM BRIEF DESCRIPTION UNIT

1 Liquid Polymer (approx 1800 gal / 50lb drum) LB

2 Liquid Ferric Chloride (approx 4000 gal /15 gal drum) GAL

3 Liquid Ferric Chloride (approx 7000 gal /275 gal tote) GAL

4
Liquid Cationic Praestol K 144 L (approx 5000 gal /275 gal 
tote) GAL

5 Sodium Hypochlorite

5a 1000-1500 gallon shipment - 1 plant GAL

5b 1500-2000 gallon shipment - 1 plant GAL

5c 2000-2500 gallon shipment - 2 plants GAL

5d 2500-3000 gallon shipment - 2 plants GAL

5e 3000-3500 gallon shipment - 2 plants GAL

6 Liquid Chlorine (approx 18 tons / one ton cylinder) TON

7 Caustic Soda (approx 35,000 gal) CWT

NA2O Concentration

Tank Truck Capacity

8 Liquid Aluminum Sulfate (approx 60,000 gal) TON

Tank Truck Capacity

9 Hydrofluosilicic acid (approx 8000 gal) GAL

Tank Truck Capacity

Concentration

10 Copper Sulfate (approx 8 ton / 50 lb bag) BAG

Manufacturer

11 Calgon C-39 (approx 17 ton / 50 lb bag) BAG

12 Magnafloc 1t 7981 Liquid Polymer (approx 750 gal) GAL

13 Domestic Sodium Floride (approx 7 tons / 50 lb bag) EA

14 Liquid Aluminum Chlorohydrate (approx 8000 gal) GAL

15 Solid Copper Sulfate Compound (approx 4200 lbs) LB

16 Liquid Chelated Copper (approx 1200 gal)

Delivered and unloaded in totes LB

Delivered and unloaded in tons LB

17 Hydrogen Dioxide (approx 77,000 lbs / 50lb bags) LB
FOB

TERMS
SURETY

UNIT  PRICE RENTAL UNIT  PRICE RENTAL

1.14$        n/a no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

9.804$      no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid 4.41$        

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

5% bid bond
net 30

Norwich

bank ck $1764
net 30

Norwich

SNF Polydyne Inc
One Chemical Plant Rd

Riceboro GA 31323

Summit Research Labs Inc
45 Rive Rd STE 300

Flemington NJ  08822-6026



BID #: 7281
June 24, 2011, 2:00pm

Bulk Chemicals
DEPARTMENT: 

NPU
ITEM BRIEF DESCRIPTION UNIT

1 Liquid Polymer (approx 1800 gal / 50lb drum) LB

2 Liquid Ferric Chloride (approx 4000 gal /15 gal drum) GAL

3 Liquid Ferric Chloride (approx 7000 gal /275 gal tote) GAL

4
Liquid Cationic Praestol K 144 L (approx 5000 gal /275 gal 
tote) GAL

5 Sodium Hypochlorite

5a 1000-1500 gallon shipment - 1 plant GAL

5b 1500-2000 gallon shipment - 1 plant GAL

5c 2000-2500 gallon shipment - 2 plants GAL

5d 2500-3000 gallon shipment - 2 plants GAL

5e 3000-3500 gallon shipment - 2 plants GAL

6 Liquid Chlorine (approx 18 tons / one ton cylinder) TON

7 Caustic Soda (approx 35,000 gal) CWT

NA2O Concentration

Tank Truck Capacity

8 Liquid Aluminum Sulfate (approx 60,000 gal) TON

Tank Truck Capacity

9 Hydrofluosilicic acid (approx 8000 gal) GAL

Tank Truck Capacity

Concentration

10 Copper Sulfate (approx 8 ton / 50 lb bag) BAG

Manufacturer

11 Calgon C-39 (approx 17 ton / 50 lb bag) BAG

12 Magnafloc 1t 7981 Liquid Polymer (approx 750 gal) GAL

13 Domestic Sodium Floride (approx 7 tons / 50 lb bag) EA

14 Liquid Aluminum Chlorohydrate (approx 8000 gal) GAL

15 Solid Copper Sulfate Compound (approx 4200 lbs) LB

16 Liquid Chelated Copper (approx 1200 gal)

Delivered and unloaded in totes LB

Delivered and unloaded in tons LB

17 Hydrogen Dioxide (approx 77,000 lbs / 50lb bags) LB
FOB

TERMS
SURETY

UNIT  PRICE RENTAL UNIT  PRICE RENTAL

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid 365.00$    

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

6.93$        
 PAX-XL19       
minimum. 1000 no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

5000 gallons

Norwich WTP
net 30

bank ck $2956.50cashier's ck $2772
net 30

delivered

Kemira Water Solutions Inc
3211 Clinton Parkway Ct

Lawrence KS  66047-2654

Holland Company Inc
153 Howland Ave
Adams MA  01220



BID #: 7281
June 24, 2011, 2:00pm

Bulk Chemicals
DEPARTMENT: 

NPU
ITEM BRIEF DESCRIPTION UNIT

1 Liquid Polymer (approx 1800 gal / 50lb drum) LB

2 Liquid Ferric Chloride (approx 4000 gal /15 gal drum) GAL

3 Liquid Ferric Chloride (approx 7000 gal /275 gal tote) GAL

4
Liquid Cationic Praestol K 144 L (approx 5000 gal /275 gal 
tote) GAL

5 Sodium Hypochlorite

5a 1000-1500 gallon shipment - 1 plant GAL

5b 1500-2000 gallon shipment - 1 plant GAL

5c 2000-2500 gallon shipment - 2 plants GAL

5d 2500-3000 gallon shipment - 2 plants GAL

5e 3000-3500 gallon shipment - 2 plants GAL

6 Liquid Chlorine (approx 18 tons / one ton cylinder) TON

7 Caustic Soda (approx 35,000 gal) CWT

NA2O Concentration

Tank Truck Capacity

8 Liquid Aluminum Sulfate (approx 60,000 gal) TON

Tank Truck Capacity

9 Hydrofluosilicic acid (approx 8000 gal) GAL

Tank Truck Capacity

Concentration

10 Copper Sulfate (approx 8 ton / 50 lb bag) BAG

Manufacturer

11 Calgon C-39 (approx 17 ton / 50 lb bag) BAG

12 Magnafloc 1t 7981 Liquid Polymer (approx 750 gal) GAL

13 Domestic Sodium Floride (approx 7 tons / 50 lb bag) EA

14 Liquid Aluminum Chlorohydrate (approx 8000 gal) GAL

15 Solid Copper Sulfate Compound (approx 4200 lbs) LB

16 Liquid Chelated Copper (approx 1200 gal)

Delivered and unloaded in totes LB

Delivered and unloaded in tons LB

17 Hydrogen Dioxide (approx 77,000 lbs / 50lb bags) LB
FOB

TERMS
SURETY

UNIT  PRICE RENTAL

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

Pencco Inc
PO Box 600

San Felipe TX  77473

NO BID


