
BID #: 7282
June 28, 2011 2:00pm

Inspection Maintenance and Repair of Fire Extinguishers

DEPARTMENT: 
NPU / NPW / NPS

Inspect, Hydrostatic Testing, and Six Year Maintenance

ITEM Extinguisher Type QTY UNIT
Annual 

Inspection
6 Yr 

Maintenance Hydro Test Recharge
Annual 

Inspection
6 Yr 

Maintenance Hydro Test Recharge

1 ABC - 2.5 lb 320 EA 3.00$          10.00$           10.00$        10.00$         5.80$          6.50$            12.00$       10.80$                 

ABC - 5 lb 3.00$          10.00$           10.00$        15.00$         5.80$          6.50$            12.00$       14.20$                 

ABC - 10 lb 3.00$          10.00$           10.00$        20.00$         5.80$          6.50$            12.00$       20.40$                 

2 Carbon Dioxide 84 EA 3.00$          -$               10.00$        $2.00/lb 5.80$          no bid 15.00$       $2.00/LB

3 Pressurized Water 87 EA 3.00$          -$               10.00$        $15.00/w af 5.80$          no bid 12.00$       $12 w/o af, $47 w/a

4 Halon - 9 4 EA 3.00$          10.00$           10.00$        45.00$         5.80$          34.80$          15.00$       no bid

Halon - 13 3.00$          10.00$           10.00$        75.00$         5.80$          38.80$          15.00$       no bid

5 Wet Chemical 11 EA 3.00$          -$               10.00$        40.00$         5.80$          no bid 12.00$       no bid

Wet Chemical (.6 liter)

Wet Chemical (2.5 liter)

6 BC - 25 lb 7 EA 3.00$          10.00$           10.00$        50.00$         5.80$          no bid 12.00$       10.80$                 

BC - 5 lb 3.00$          10.00$           10.00$        15.00$         5.80$          no bid 12.00$       14.20$                 

BC - 10 lb 3.00$          10.00$           10.00$        20.00$         5.80$          no bid 12.00$       20.40$                 

Repair Labor Charge

Straught Time / hr 60.00$        65.00$        

Over time / hr 75.00$        97.50$        

Replacement Fire Extinguishers

SIZE Extinguisher Type
Price 

Delivered Mfg Warranty
Price 

Delivered Mfg Warranty

2.5 ABC EA 29.00$        Buckeye 1 yr 35.75 not listed not listed

5 ABC EA 49.00$        Buckeye 1 yr 47.20$        not listed not listed

10 ABC EA 89.00$        Buckeye 1 yr 77.75$        not listed not listed

2.5 BC EA 30.00$        Buckeye 1 yr 35.75$        not listed not listed

5 BC EA 50.00$        Buckeye 1 yr 47.20$        not listed not listed

10 BC EA 90.00$        Buckeye 1 yr 77.75$        not listed not listed

5 Carbon Dioxide EA 125.00$      Buckeye 1 yr 143.50$      not listed not listed

10 Carbon Dioxide EA 225.00$      Buckeye 1 yr 208.00$      not listed not listed

15 Carbon Dioxide EA 285.00$      Buckeye 1 yr 242.00$      not listed not listed

20 Carbon Dioxide EA 350.00$      Buckeye 1 yr 298.00$      not listed not listed

2.5 Pressurized Water EA 150.00$      Buckeye 1 yr 97.85$        not listed not listed

9 Halon EA N/A N/A N/A no bid not listed not listed

13 Halon EA N/A N/A N/A no bid not listed not listed

5 Halotron (substitute) EA

11 Halotron (substitute) EA

15.5 Halotron (substitute) EA

6 hr Wet Chemical EA 195.00$      Buckeye 1 yr 169.05$      not listed not listed

Roybal & Sons

Middlefield, CT 06455
PO 204

Southern NE Fire Protection

Plainville, CT 06062
PO Box 879



BID #: 7282
June 28, 2011 2:00pm

Inspection Maintenance and Repair of Fire Extinguishers

DEPARTMENT: 
NPU / NPW / NPS

Inspect, Hydrostatic Testing, and Six Year Maintenance

ITEM Extinguisher Type QTY UNIT

1 ABC - 2.5 lb 320 EA

ABC - 5 lb

ABC - 10 lb

2 Carbon Dioxide 84 EA

3 Pressurized Water 87 EA

4 Halon - 9 4 EA

Halon - 13

5 Wet Chemical 11 EA

Wet Chemical (.6 liter)

Wet Chemical (2.5 liter)

6 BC - 25 lb 7 EA

BC - 5 lb

BC - 10 lb

Repair Labor Charge

Straught Time / hr

Over time / hr

Replacement Fire Extinguishers

SIZE Extinguisher Type

2.5 ABC EA

5 ABC EA

10 ABC EA

2.5 BC EA

5 BC EA

10 BC EA

5 Carbon Dioxide EA

10 Carbon Dioxide EA

15 Carbon Dioxide EA

20 Carbon Dioxide EA

2.5 Pressurized Water EA

9 Halon EA

13 Halon EA

5 Halotron (substitute) EA

11 Halotron (substitute) EA

15.5 Halotron (substitute) EA

6 hr Wet Chemical EA

Annual 
Inspection

6 Yr 
Maintenance Hydro Test Recharge

Annual 
Inspection

6 Yr 
Maintenance Hydro Test Recharge

Annual 
Inspection

1.60$          5.25$           10.00$        6.95$           3.00$          15.00$          21.00$        11.00$         3.95$          

1.60$          5.25$           10.00$        12.75$         3.00$          17.00$          23.00$        12.00$         3.95$          

1.60$          5.25$           10.00$        15.25$         3.00$          25.00$          30.00$        20.00$         3.95$          

1.60$          no bid 15.00$        $4.00/lb 3.00$          16.00$          43.00$        $16.00/ 10 lb 3.95$          

1.60$          no bid 8.00$          $8.00/w af 3.00$          11.00$          20.00$        - 3.95$          

1.60$          15.00$         15.00$        $40.00/bottle 3.00$          45.00$          56.00$        45.00$         3.95$          

1.60$          15.00$         15.00$        no bid 3.00$          48.00$          58.00$        48.00$         3.95$          

1.60$          no bid 12.00$        54.00$         3.00$          69.00$          78.00$        69.00$         

3.95$          

3.95$          

1.60$          5.25$           10.00$        20.00$         3.00$          17.00$          23.00$        13.00$         3.95$          

1.60$          5.25$           10.00$        12.00$         3.00$          19.00$          25.00$        14.00$         3.95$          

1.60$          5.25$           10.00$        15.00$         3.00$          27.00$          32.00$        22.00$         3.95$          

65.00$        75.00$        55.00$        

65.00$        140.00$      90.00$        

Price 
Delivered Mfg Warranty

Price 
Delivered Mfg Warranty

Price 
Delivered

27.00$        Buckeye 1 yr 29.00$        Amerex 6 yr 31.00$        

39.00$        Buckeye 1 yr 40.00$        6 yr 45.00$        

65.00$        Buckeye 1 yr 59.00$        6 yr 64.90$        

23.00$        Buckeye 1 yr 30.00$        6 yr 30.35$        

33.00$        Buckeye 1 yr 42.00$        6 yr 40.50$        

54.00$        Buckeye 1 yr 61.00$        6 yr 67.60$        

115.00$      Buckeye 1 yr 119.00$      5 yr 128.00$      

150.00$      Buckeye 1 yr 209.00$      5 yr 158.00$      

171.00$      Buckeye 1 yr 234.00$      5 yr 188.00$      

188.00$      Buckeye 1 yr no bid 5 yr 222.00$      

79.00$        Buckeye 1 yr 95.00$        5 yr 94.00$        

136.50$      Buckeye 1 yr 298.00$      

159.50$      Buckeye 1 yr 397.75$      

150.00$      5 yr

335.00$      5 yr

475.00$      5 yr

148.00$      Buckeye 1 yr 159.95$      5 yr 138.00$      

325 Sandbank Rd 394 Eaast Street
Life Safety Service & Supply

Chesire, CT 06410

Cintas Fire Protection

Plainville CT  06062



BID #: 7282
June 28, 2011 2:00pm

Inspection Maintenance and Repair of Fire Extinguishers

DEPARTMENT: 
NPU / NPW / NPS

Inspect, Hydrostatic Testing, and Six Year Maintenance

ITEM Extinguisher Type QTY UNIT

1 ABC - 2.5 lb 320 EA

ABC - 5 lb

ABC - 10 lb

2 Carbon Dioxide 84 EA

3 Pressurized Water 87 EA

4 Halon - 9 4 EA

Halon - 13

5 Wet Chemical 11 EA

Wet Chemical (.6 liter)

Wet Chemical (2.5 liter)

6 BC - 25 lb 7 EA

BC - 5 lb

BC - 10 lb

Repair Labor Charge

Straught Time / hr

Over time / hr

Replacement Fire Extinguishers

SIZE Extinguisher Type

2.5 ABC EA

5 ABC EA

10 ABC EA

2.5 BC EA

5 BC EA

10 BC EA

5 Carbon Dioxide EA

10 Carbon Dioxide EA

15 Carbon Dioxide EA

20 Carbon Dioxide EA

2.5 Pressurized Water EA

9 Halon EA

13 Halon EA

5 Halotron (substitute) EA

11 Halotron (substitute) EA

15.5 Halotron (substitute) EA

6 hr Wet Chemical EA

6 Yr 
Maintenance Hydro Test Recharge

Annual 
Inspection 6 Yr Maintenance Hydro Test Recharge

5.25$            12.00$        10.80$         3.80$          30.00$              30.00$        22.00$         

5.25$            12.00$        14.20$         3.80$          34.00$              44.00$        24.00$         

5.25$            12.00$        20.40$         3.80$          42.00$              52.00$        28.00$         

no bid 16.90$        $1.95/lb 3.80$          no bid 46.00$        $2.00/lb

no bid 8.25$          $45w af, $8.8 3.80$          no bid 42.00$        $32.00/w af

34.20$          12.00$        $14.80/lb 3.80$          62.00$              80.00$        $12.00/lb

34.20$          12.00$        $14.80/lb 3.80$          64.00$              94.00$        $12.00/lb

3.80$          no bid 110.00$      75.00$         

no bid 8.25$          68.00$         

no bid 8.25$          80.00$         

5.25$            12.00$        10.50$         3.80$          30.00$              30.00$        22.00$         

5.25$            12.00$        13.00$         3.80$          34.00$              44.00$        24.00$         

5.25$            12.00$        15.20$         3.80$          42.00$              52.00$        28.00$         

65.00$        

75.00$        

Mfg Warranty
Price 

Delivered Mfg Warranty

amerex 6 yr 42.00$        Amerex/Badger 2 yr.

51.00$        Amerex/Badger 2 yr.

92.00$        Amerex/Badger 2 yr.

no bid Amerex/Badger 2 yr.

51.00$        Amerex/Badger 2 yr.

92.00$        Amerex/Badger 2 yr.

180.00$      Amerex/Badger 2 yr.

202.00$      Amerex/Badger 2 yr.

294.00$      Amerex/Badger 2 yr.

310.00$      Amerex/Badger 2 yr.

130.00$      Amerex/Badger 2 yr.

$  290/9lb Amerex/Badger 2 yr.

$  385/13lb Amerex/Badger 2 yr.

220.00$      Amerex/Badger 2 yr.

Fire Protection Team
101 Highland Ave.
Chesire, CT 06410Waterford, CT 06385

Shipman's
172 Cross Road


