BID 7314

December 22, 2011, 2:00pm

Bulk Chemicals. Partial Re-Bid

Carus Corporation

Biosafe Systems

Borden & Remington Corp

Thatcher Co of NY

Shannon Chemical

DEPARTMENT: 315 Fifthe Street 22 Meadow Street 63 Water St PO Box 118 602 Jefferson Cir
NPU Peru IL 61354 E Hartford CT 06108-3216 Fall River MA 02721-1559 Williamson NY 14589 Exton PA 19341-2539
ITEM BRIEF DESCRIPTION UNIT UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
liquid alternate
1_|Calgon C-39 (approx 17 ton / 50 Ib bag - delivered) BAG | $ 82.50 no bid no bid $ 92.00 0.874/Ib
2 [Sodium Fluoride (approx 7 tons / 50 |b bag - delivered) BAG no bid no bid $ 53.87 no bid
3 [Solid Copper Sulfate Compound (approx 4200 Ibs) LB no bid no bid no bid no bid
4 [Liguid Chelated Copper (approx 1200 gal)
Delivered and unloaded in totes GAL no bid no bid no bid no bid
Delivered and unloaded in tons GAL no bid no bid no bid no bid
5 [Hydrogen Dioxide (approx 77,000 Ibs, 50Ib bags, delivered) | LB no bid $ 1.05 no bid no bid
Truck Capacity
DELIVERY 3 -5 days ARO 3 days ARO 7-10 days ARO
TERMS net 30 net 30 net 30 net 30
SURETY 5% bid bond bank check $4,042.50 treasurer's check $817.11 no bid bank check $3,128.00




BID 7314

December 22, 2011, 2:00pm
Bulk Chemicals. Partial Re-Bid

Coyne Chemical AIC Univar USA Inc Chemrite Inc
DEPARTMENT: 3015 State Rd 135 Newbury St 175 Terminal Rd 5202 Bellewood Court
NPU Croyden PA 19021-6962 Framingham MA 01701 Providence Rl 02905 Buford GA 30518
ITEM BRIEF DESCRIPTION UNIT | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
1_|Calgon C-39 (approx 17 ton / 50 Ib bag - delivered) BAG Nalco $51.24 no bid no bid no bid
2 |Sodium Fluoride (approx 7 tons / 50 Ib bag - delivered) BAG no bid $ 47.50 $ 48.67 $ 48.00
3 [Solid Copper Sulfate Compound (approx 4200 Ibs) LB no bid no bid no bid $ 1.92
4 [Liguid Chelated Copper (approx 1200 gal)
Delivered and unloaded in totes GAL | $ 22.10 no bid no bid no bid
Delivered and unloaded in tons GAL | $ 22.10 no bid no bid no bid
5 [Hydrogen Dioxide (approx 77,000 Ibs, 50Ib bags, delivered) | LB no bid no bid no bid no bid
Truck Capacity
DELIVERY 3 days ARO 5 days ARO 3-5 days ARO
TERMS net 30 net 30 net 30 net 30
SURETY 5% bid bond bank check $665 5% bid bond bank checks $1,075.20




